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World Quantum Day
celebrated at ICFAI

Agartala, Apr 14 : The
World Quantum Day is
celebrated every year on
April l4 every year to
promote publ ic awaieness
and understanding of
quantum-science and
technology around the
world. The Department
of Physics of The ICFAI
University Tripura
celebrated. the World
Quantum Day for the third
time in the campus during
April 9- 10.
During the inauguration

of the event lamp lighting
is doneusing water sensing
lithium battery lamps
prepared by the students of

the Department of Physics.
Prof. (Dr.) Amarjyoti
Choudhury, the renowned
Physicist, former Vice
Chancellor of Gauhati
University and Pro Vice
Chancellor of Tezpur
University inaugurated the
program as Chief Guest.
Prof. (Dr.) BiplabHalder,
Vice Chancellor of the
ICFAI University Tripura
also presided over the
inaugural session and
delivered the welcome
address.
Prof. (Dr.) Amarjyoti
Choudhury in his
speech as Chief guest
described about the
journey of the Quantum
Mechanics through stories

and anecdotes of the
invention.
Series of research
presentati on s, Debate
competitioriand Poster
Competition were
organized for the studen[s.
After the .valediciory
session. prizes were
distributed among the
witrners of each events.
The entire program was
conceptualized and hosted
by Dr. Sovan GhoSh,
Associate Pi:,ofessor of the
Department of Physics.
The celebration enfled
with a grand success ahd
the University is looking
forward to arrange more
such engrossing events in
the near future.
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Agartala: Apr 14. The
World Quantum Day is
celebrated every year today
every year to promote public
awareness and
understanding of quantum
science and technology
around the world.

The Department of Physics
of The ICFAI University
Tripura celebrated the World
Quantum Day for the third
time in the campus during 9

to l0April,2025.
. During ihe inauguration of

the event lamp lighting is
done using water sensing
lithium battery lamps
prepared by the students of
the Department of Physics.
Prof. (Dr.) Amarjyoti
Choudhury, the renowned
Physicist, fgrmer Vice
Chancellor of Gauhati
University and Pro Vice
Chancellor of Tezpur
lJniversity
program as

inaugurated the
Chief Guest.

Prof. (Dr.) BiplabHalder,
Vice Chancellor of the ICFAI
University Tripura also
presided over the inaugural
session and delivered the
welcome address. Prof. (Dr.)
Amarjyoti Choudhury in his
speech as Chief guest
described the journey.gf
Quantum lr4echanics through
stories and anecdotes of the
invention. Series of re.search
presentations, Debate
competition and Poster
Competition were organized
for the students. After the
valedictory session, prizes
were distributed among the
winners of each event.

The entir€ plogram was
cbnceptualized and' hosted
by Dr. Sovan Ghosh,
Associate Professor of the
Department of Physics" The
celebration ended with a
grand succest and the
University is looking forward
to arranging more such
engrossing events in the near
future.
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